
VENUE DATE TIME CELEBRATIONS AND INTENTIONS AND MEETINGS 

Parish Church Saturday 9th  7.30pm The Vigil for the Twenty-Third Sunday in Ordinary Time: 

John & Michael Loftus, Cullane 

John & Margaret Gaughan, Byhalla, (Facebook Live) 

Parish Church Sunday 10th 10.30am Mass for the Twenty Third Sunday in Ordinary Time: 

People of the Parish 

Parish Church Monday 11th  9.30am Sean & Sean Óg Mulherin, Carrick 

Fr. Peyton Centre Tuesday 12th 12.15pm Intentions of the Seniors Group (Facebook Live).  

Parish Church Wednesday 13th  9.30am Michael, Bridget & Joe Loftus, Graffey 

Parish Church Thursday 14th  9.30am Holy Souls 

Parish Church Friday 15th  ———- NO EVENING MASS 

Parish Church Saturday 16th 11.00am Richard Engel Currower  (Month’s Mind) (Facebook Live) 

Parish Church Saturday 16th  7.30pm The Vigil for the Twenty-Fourth Sunday in Ordinary Time: 

Patsy, Val, Barry Gilboy, Leeds, Kilgellia & Carrick 

Deceased members of Gillespie family & Sarah Gaughan,    

Byhalla (Facebook Live) 

Parish Church Sunday 17th 10.30am Mass for the Twenty-Fourth Sunday in Ordinary Time: 

People of the Parish 

NEWSLETTER 

Inspired by the Life and Work of the Venerable Patrick Peyton CSC, we 

the people of Attymass Parish strive to build a Community that is rooted 

in Gospel Values and is deeply committed to the Mission of Jesus. 

Parish Mission Statement 

MONTH OF SEPTEMBER 

CHURCH DIARY THIS WEEK  

PARISH AND DIOCESAN SAFE GUARDING 

www.achonrydiocese.org/diocesan-policy 

PARISH REPRESENTATIVES 

Veronica Peyton and Hugh McHugh 

Fr. John Maloney 

Parochial Administrator 
Parish House and Office: 096-29990 

Parish Mobile: 085-2552984  

attymassparish@achonrydiocese.org 

Facebook: www.facebook.com/

stjosephschurchattymass  

Twitter: @AttymassParish 

St. Feichin’s National School 
Telephone 096-45076 

office@attymassns.ie.  

Twitter: @AttymassNS 

Fr. Peyton Memorial Centre 
Opening Hours:  

Monday to Friday from 10am to 5.30pm 

Saturday from 12.00pm to 5.00pm 

If you need assistance please phone         

096 45374. . 

NEWSLETTER ITEMS: Under  GDPR, the protection of your  personal data is impor tant to us. We are happy 

to include your notice in our Parish Bulletin, but please ensure that you have received the consent of any persons      

referenced before submitting a notice to us. Please submit items by Wednesday evening at 8pm, via email 

(attymassparish@achonrydiocese.org) if possible and please include your  contact details. Thank you. 

Newsletters are single use items. If you take one upon entering the Church, please bring it 

home do not leave it in the seat as it will have to be thrown away.  



 
 
 
 

We remember in our prayers all those 
whose anniversaries occur around this 
time.  May they rest in peace. 

A sincere thanks to all who have handed 
in their contributions (the weekly        
envelopes) for the support of the parish. 
Please know that your support is very 
much appreciated and not taken for    
granted. Fr John 

The A.G.M. Of Bonnifinglas Cemetery 
Care Committee will take place on     
Tuesday 12th September at 8.30pm in the 
Community Centre 

1.Please sanitise your hands as you enter 
the church. 
2. There is no room in the sacristy to             
accommodate people  Please wait in 
your seat if you wish to see Fr. John 

Gluten Free Hosts are available at all 
Parishes Masses. If you wish to receive a 
Gluten Free Host please contact Fr. John. 

Congratulations to the recent lotto       
winners Clara Bourke, Shraheen who 
won a jackpot of €635 and Pat Guiry who 
won a jackpot of €614 in the Moy Davitts 
50/50 draw. A huge thank you to every 
one who supported last week's draw, it is 
greatly appreciated. Tickets are available 
in the usual retail outlets and by clicking 
https://smartlotto.ie/Bohola-moy-davitts 

Knock Market will resume Sunday, 24th 
September at Pope Francis Plaza,        
adjacent to Knock Shrine. Browse the 
colourful stalls which offer fabulous 
handmade crafts made by local crafters 
and artists here in the west of Ireland. 
Visit Knock Shrine & Museum. Lots of 
gift shops to enjoy too. Free admission to 
the market which offers free car parking 
(disabled friendly) and toilet facilities 
close by. For bookings contact:             
leoniekilroy@gmail.com 
+++++++++++++++++++++++++++++ 
“The attitude of Mary of Nazareth shows 
us that being comes before doing, and to 
leave the doing to God in order to be truly 
as he wants us.”  
Pope Francis, Angelus, 8th Dec 2014  

Bishop Paul Dempsey will lead a special 
celebration of the Sacrament of the Sick 
in St Nathy’s Cathedral, Ballaghaderreen 
on September 17th at 4.00pm. Please note 
that this celebration will not include the 
celebration of Mass. All those whose 
health is impaired because of illness or 
old age are invited and welcome to avail 
of this sacrament  

The Diocesan Adoration Committee will 
be visiting the parish the weekend of 30th 
September and 1st October. More details 
next weekend. The Friday evening Holy 
Hour will resume on Friday 22nd       
September. 

Charlie and Christina Gallagher Currower 
are holding their annual Hospice Coffee 
Day on Saturday the 23rd September 
from 10am-5pm. All welcome to attend. 

Bofield CCÉ are hosting a Table Quiz:  
Friday 15th Sept in The Cot & Cobble 
Ballina.  Registration at 8:30pm - Starting 
at 9:00pm sharp. Prizes for 1st, 2nd & 3rd 
places. Lots of spot prizes on the night. 
Entry €20.00 per table of 4. All welcome 
for a fun night. 

The Totus Tuus Men for Christ            
Conference 2023 - a Catholic Conference 
for Men will be LIVE & EXCLUSIVE on 
Radio Maria Ireland Saturday 16th      
September from 2pm. Speakers for this 
years Conference are Fr. Billy Swan, Fr. 
Chris Hayden, Anthony Crossey & Fr. 
John Harris OP 

Ballina Toastmasters warmly welcomes 
you to our Club meeting on Thursday 
14th September 2023 at 7:45pm in the 
Great National Hotel, Foxford Rd,      
Ballina. If you feel anxious or nervous 
speaking in a social setting, giving 
presentations in your workplace or having 
to undertake a leadership role, let      
Toastmasters help you through this      
journey. With Toastmasters you will 
learn to take your first steps to find your 
voice, calm nerves and learn in an       
encouraging, friendly and sociable      
environment. 
 
 
 

Enable Ireland Mayo Services require 
Volunteers in all areas of County Mayo to 
work with Children with a disability. Our 
volunteers usually work one-to-one with 
a child within their home but also within 
their community or at our centre in      
Castlebar. No more than three hours are 
required per week. We work around your 
availability to make this exciting         
opportunity suit your lifestyle. Training is 
also provided. If you are interested please 
contact Fiona at 087 6808350 or email 
fscully@enableireland.ie for further     
information 

Ward Agricultural Consultants are      
holding ACRES training days on          
Saturday 23rd and 30th September,      
October 7th and 14th.  Call Siobhan on 
087 9193371 to book your place on the 
course. This course is mandatory for all 
farmers who joined ACRES  

1. While Jesus is referring to a group    
situation, the advice can be applied also 
to personal difficulties and problems with 
others. What lessons has life taught you 
about constructive ways of dealing with 
conflict?  
2. Jesus also promises to be with his    
followers when they gather together. 
What does that mean to you? How have 
you experienced the presence of Jesus in 
his followers gathered together? During 
the recent lockdown due to the           
coronavirus, how did you experience the 
presence of Jesus in your faith            
community?  
Intercom: Fr. John Byrne OSA 

PLEASE PRAY FOR  

Dear Jesus, the Venerable Patrick Peyton 
devoted his priestly life to strengthening 
the families of the world by calling them 
to pray together everyday, especially the 
Rosary. His message is as important for 
us now as it was during his life on earth. 
We beg you, therefore, to hasten the day 
of his beatification, so that your faithful                 
people everywhere will remember his 
message that the family that prays      
together stays together, will imitate him 
in his devotion to your Mother and ours, 
and will be inspired by his holy life to 
draw ever closer to you with childlike 
confidence and love. Amen 

BEATIFICATION PRAYER 

PARISH ADORATION 

OFFERTORY COLLECTIONS 

HOSPICE COFFEE DAY 

MOY DAVITTS 

TOTUS TUUS CONFERENCE 

CHURCH SAFETY 

MARKET @ THE PLAZA 

BONNIFINGLAS CEMETERY 

PARISH MINISTRIES 

BALLINA TOASTMASTERS 

BOFIELD CCÉ TABLE QUIZ 

GLUTEN FREE HOSTS 

Saturday 16th September  

Reader:  Mary Lavelle 

Eucharist:  Margaret Conlon 

Sunday 17th September 

Reader: Noreen Quinn 

Eucharist: Monica Ferguson 

DIOCESAN CELEBRATION 

OF THE SACRAMMENT OF 

THE SICK 

ENABLE IRELAND MAYO 

ACRES TRAINING DAYS 

LENS OF THE GOSPEL 


